

073/21 - Revenge Porn

Under the Freedom of Information Act I request:-

From April 2015, to the most recent data available, split into 6 month intervals.

1) The number of cases of revenge porn - crimes recorded under Home Office code 008/71 Disclosure of private sexual photographs and films with intent to cause distress - reported to your force.

Fiscal Year	Semester 1	Semester 2	Total
2015/16	20	30	50
2016/17	44	53	97
2017/18	47	58	105
2018/19	54	67	121
2019/20	64	71	135
2020/21	91	45	136
Total	320	324	644

(Data to 18/01/2021)

1.a) The data broken down by age group of the victims - 0-10, 11-15, 16-20, 21-30, 31-40, 41-50, 51-60, 60+.

Year	Age group													Age not stated	Total
	0 to 10	11 to 15	16 to 20	21 to 25	26 to 30	31 to 35	36 to 40	41 to 45	46 to 50	51 to 55	56 to 60	60+			
2015/16															
Semester 1	0	1	7	4	2	1	2	1	0	1	0	0	1	20	
Semester 2	0	1	8	5	5	6	1	3	0	0	0	1	0	30	
2016/17															
Semester 1	0	1	11	14	3	7	3	0	2	2	0	0	1	44	
Semester 2	0	2	11	18	9	4	8	1	0	0	0	0	0	53	
2017/18															
Semester 1	0	0	16	6	8	8	4	2	1	1	0	1	0	47	
Semester 2	0	1	14	15	11	7	6	1	2	0	1	0	0	58	
2018/19															
Semester 1	0	1	12	13	12	7	5	2	1	1	0	0	0	54	
Semester 2	0	6	14	12	19	8	4	1	1	0	1	0	1	67	
2019/20															
Semester 1	0	4	14	18	8	5	11	0	2	1	0	0	1	64	
Semester 2	0	6	12	20	12	10	5	2	2	1	0	0	1	71	
2020/21															
Semester 1	2	3	20	25	17	9	7	4	2	0	1	0	1	91	
Semester 2	1	4	10	13	4	5	1	3	1	1	0	0	2	45	
Total	3	30	149	163	110	77	57	20	14	8	3	2	8	644	

(Data to 18/01/2021)

1.b) What was the outcome for these cases (ie charged/summonsed, cases pending, caution, case dropped etc).

Outcome	2015/16	2016/17	2017/18	2018/19	2019/20	2020/21	Total
Semester 1							
Total	20	44	47	54	64	91	320
Caution adult	3	5	2	4	2	2	18
Charge/Summons	4	5	4	9	2	3	27
Community resolution	1	0	2	1	1	0	5
Evidential difficulties	4	9	10	11	22	29	85
Investigation complete - no suspect identified	1	12	10	11	18	21	73
Not in public interest (police)	1	0	0	2	0	0	3
Suspect too ill	0	0	1	0	0	0	1
Victim declines or is unable to identify suspect	2	2	4	4	0	7	19
Victim does not support police action	4	11	14	12	19	26	86
Not recorded	0	0	0	0	0	3	3
Semester 2							
Total	30	53	58	67	71	45	324
Caution adult	3	8	4	3	2	1	21
Caution youth	1	0	0	0	0	0	1
Charge/Summons	4	5	3	4	6	0	22
Community resolution	0	1	0	2	0	1	4
Evidential difficulties	9	6	12	23	19	17	86
Investigation complete - no suspect identified	3	11	17	14	26	7	78
Investigation not in public interest	1	0	0	0	0	0	1
Not in public interest (police)	1	1	0	2	0	1	5
Other agency action	0	0	0	1	1	0	2
Victim declines or is unable to identify suspect	0	5	1	3	2	3	14
Victim does not support police action	8	15	21	13	14	8	79
YOT triage	0	1	0	0	0	0	1
Not recorded	0	0	0	2	1	7	10
Total	50	97	105	121	135	136	644

(Data to 18/01/2021)