
Under the Freedom of Information Act I request:-

1a) How many people did you charge with the offence of murder in the 2017 calendar year? 

13

b) How many of these individuals were recorded as not being a UK national? 

0

N/A

2a) How many people did you charge with the offence of rape in the 2017 calendar year? 

59

b) How many of these individuals were recorded as not being a UK national? 

10

1 Congolese

1 German

1 Indian

2 Iraqi

4 Romanian

1 Slovakian

Note: Please do not include attempt offences and if you do not hold information on nationality of suspects please state so.

3. For the 2017 calendar years could you state how many people you arrested who were recorded by your force as being (i) Romanian, (ii) Albanian and (iii) Syrian citizens?

Albanian Romanian Syrian

15 178 14

4. For the 2017 calendar year please provide me with a table showing the number of (i)Romanian, (ii) Albanian and (iii) Syrian people* arrested for each type of offence by your force.

Offence Type Albanian Romanian Syrian

0 8 0

0 3 1

1 1 0

0 17 0

0 1 0

11 72 4

0 3 1

2 20 7

0 81 0

1 9 3

15 213 16

*Note this table shows the number of arrests not the number of people arrested

Drug crime

Criminal damage

Burglary

Total*

c) Please provide a table showing the nationality of all those people who were not recorded as being a UK national who were charged with 

murder in the 2017 calendar year.

c) Please provide a table showing the nationality of all those people who were not recorded as being a UK national who were charged with rape 

in the 2017 calendar year.

Violence Against the Person

Theft and handling

Sexual offences

Public disorder

Non Crime

Modern Slavery

Miscellaneous crime
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