

FOIA - 1051/20 - Missing Persons including During Lockdown

Under the Freedom of Information Act I request:-

1. The number of people who have been reported missing to this force during the calendar year of 2017-2018, 2018-2019, 2019-2020?

Year	Count
2017	3,787
2018	4,077
2019	4,368
2020	3,243
Total	15,475

2. The number of people reported missing who were then found during the calendar year of 2017-2018, 2018-2019, 2019-2020?

Year	Count
2017	3,782
2018	4,064
2019	4,361
2020	3,193
Total	15,400

3. Can this be broken down by gender please?

Year	Male	Female	Unknown	Total
2017	2,321	1,463	3	3,787
2018	2,522	1,551	4	4,077
2019	2,709	1,655	4	4,368
2020	1,949	1,299	5	3,243
Total	9,501	5,958	16	15,475

Year	Male	Female	Unknown	Total
2017	2,317	1,462	3	3,782
2018	2,513	1,547	4	4,064
2019	2,705	1,652	4	4,361
2020	1,909	1,279	4	3,193
Total	9,444	5,940	15	15,400

4. Can this be broken down by ethnicity please?

Ethnicity	2017	2018	2019	2020	Total
Asian	80	93	84	47	304
Black	57	68	53	49	227
Chinese, Japanese, South East Asian	8	12	8	8	36
Middle Eastern	10	8	9	4	31
White - North European	3,460	3,681	3,956	2,906	14,003
White - South European	30	35	37	22	124
Other/Unknown	142	180	221	207	750
Total	3,787	4,077	4,368	3,243	15,475

Ethnicity	2017	2018	2019	2020	Total
Asian	75	93	83	44	295
Black	57	67	53	47	224
Chinese, Japanese, South East Asian	8	12	8	7	35
Middle Eastern	10	8	9	4	31
White - North European	3,460	3,673	3,951	2,864	13,948
White - South European	30	35	37	22	124
Other/Unknown	142	176	220	205	743
Total	3,782	4,064	4,361	3,193	15,400

5. Can this be broken down by each age range from 0-10, 10-20, 20-30, 30-40, 40-50, 50-60, 60-70, 70+, please?

Age group	2017	2018	2019	2020	Total
0 to 10	84	99	79	77	339
11 to 20	1,551	1,576	1,663	1,352	6,142
21 to 30	755	828	853	562	2,998
31 to 40	613	736	819	573	2,741
41 to 50	361	420	410	323	1,514
51 to 60	233	229	274	155	891
61 to 70	92	83	119	83	377
70+	86	90	132	107	415
Not recorded	12	16	19	11	58
Total	3,787	4,077	4,368	3,243	15,475

Age	2017	2018	2019	2020	Total
0 to 10	84	98	79	77	338
11 to 20	1,551	1,575	1,662	1,336	6,124
21 to 30	753	826	852	557	2,988
31 to 40	611	732	818	560	2,721
41 to 50	360	419	409	313	1,501
51 to 60	233	227	272	153	885
61 to 70	92	81	119	80	372
70+	86	90	132	106	414
Not recorded	12	16	18	11	57
Total	3,782	4,064	4,361	3,193	15,400

6. The number of people who have been reported as missing to this force during the lockdown period from 23rd March 2020 – 4th July 2020?

1,445

7. The number of people reported missing who were then found during the lockdown period from 23rd March 2020 – 4th July 2020?

1,432

8. Can this be broken down by gender please?

Gender	Count	Gender	Count
Male	881	Male	870
Female	563	Female	561
Not recorded	1	Not recorded	1
Total	1,445	Total	1,432

9. Can this be broken down by ethnicity please?

Ethnicity	Count
Asian	21
Black	14
Chinese, Japanese, South East Asian	6
Middle Eastern	1
White - North European	1,307
White - South European	9
Other/Unknown	87
Total	1,445

Ethnicity	Count
Asian	19
Black	13
Chinese, Japanese, South East Asian	6
Middle Eastern	1
White - North European	1,298
White - South European	9
Other/Unknown	86
Total	1,432

10. Can this be broken down by each age range from 0-10, 10-20, 20-30, 30-40, 40-50, 50-60, 60-70, 70+, please?

Age group	Count	Age group	Count
0 to 10	28	0 to 10	28
11 to 20	532	11 to 20	528
21 to 30	290	21 to 30	288
31 to 40	292	31 to 40	288
41 to 50	148	41 to 50	146
51 to 60	77	51 to 60	76
61 to 70	27	61 to 70	27
70+	48	70+	48
Not recorded	3	Not recorded	3
Total	1,445	Total	1,432